


THIRTY-SECOND SUNDAY IN ORDINARY TIME

SATURDAY, NOVEMBER 5

       5:00 pm For the Repose of the Souls of those

listed on All Souls Envelopes and Book

of Remembrance

SUNDAY, NOVEMBER 6

  9:00 am The People of the Parish

11:00 am For the Repose of the Souls of those     

    listed on All Souls Envelopes and Book 

      of Remembrance

TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 8

  7:00 pm Bruna Creglia R.I.P. - Clara Creglia

WEDNESDAY, NOVEMBER 9

  9:00 am Joseph Tri Ngo R.I.P. - Ngo Family

THURSDAY, NOVEMBER 10

  7:00 pm For the Repose of the Souls of those

listed on All Souls Envelopes and Book

of Remembrance

FRIDAY, NOVEMBER 11

9:00 am Peter Neysmith R.I.P. - Ann Neysmith

SATURDAY, NOVEMBER 12

       5:00 pm For the Repose of the Souls of those

listed on All Souls Envelopes and Book

of Remembrance

SUNDAY, NOVEMBER 13

  9:00 am For the Repose of the Souls of those

listed on All Souls Envelopes and Book

of Remembrance

11:00 am The People of the Parish

Sick: That the sick may be consoled,
especially Fr. Ralph Paonessa, OFM
(very sick), and Teresa Borrelli.

Deceased: That all who have died may rejoice in
eternal peace, especially Rev. William Fitzgerald
and Paolo Zappia.

Pope’s November Prayer Intention: For children
who suffer - We pray for the children who are
suffering, especially those who are homeless,
orphans, and victims of war; may they be
guaranteed access to education and the opportunity
to experience family affection.

We may ask the
question, “Why pray
for the dead?”  The
Church teaches us
that for those who
are already in

heaven we are not praying for them but we are
rather asking them to intercede, for us and others,
before the throne of God.  We are also thanking
God for their lives, examples and many graces that
have come upon the world through their
intercession.  For those who have not yet reached
heaven, but are in purgatory, we are assisting them
in their struggle of purification.  This is a great help
to them and we will only know in the next world how
much it meant to them. Before her death St. Monica
said to her son St. Augustine, “Bury my body
wherever you will;...One thing only I ask you, that
you remember me at the altar of the Lord wherever
you may be.”

During the month of November, beginning with The
Commemoration of All the Faithful Departed (All
Souls’ Day), a Book of Remembrance containing
the names of deceased relatives and friends will be
placed near the statue of Our Lady during the
month of November.  You are invited to write in the
names of your recently deceased relatives or
friends.   The November Masses listed below will
be offered for the Repose of the Souls of those
listed on All Souls envelopes and Book of
Remembrance.  All Souls envelopes may be
dropped in the donation box in the church foyer. 
Envelopes for All Souls can be found beside the
donation box or in your box set of Sunday Offering
envelopes.

Saturday   November 5   5:00 p.m.

Sunday   November 6 11:00 a.m.

Thursday   November 10   7:00 p.m.

Saturday   November 12   5:00 p.m.

Sunday   November 13   9:00 a.m.

Tuesday   November 15   7:00 p.m.

Saturday   November 19   5:00 p.m.

Sunday   November 20 11:00 a.m.

Friday   November 25   9:00 a.m.

Saturday   November 26   5:00 p.m.

Sunday   November 27   9:00 a.m.

Wednesday   November 30   9:00 a.m.



NOVEMBER 6, 2022

Friday, November 11, 2022

Canadians pause on November 11 in silence to
remember those who died in war and to pray for the
victims of aggression and inhumanity throughout the
world.  This is a day to pray for peace, to consider
what we are doing as individuals, as a community
and as a nation to bring God’s peace into the world. 
This is a day when a believing community should
rededicate itself by prayer and action to the ideals
Jesus gives us in the beatitudes.

Weekly Offering (Oct 30) . . . . . . . . . . . $3,066.80

Expenses (Oct 24 - Oct 30) . . . . . . . . . $2,470.35

Thank you for your contribution.

The Shepherds’ Trust Collection

There will be a second collection next
weekend, November 12/13, for The
Shepherds’ Trust.  The mission of The
Shepherds’ Trust is to help ensure that
elderly and disabled priests are provided
with sufficient financial resources to lead

a dignified life after many years of ministry.  Your
generous gift will help our priests to maintain a
modest but active and independent lifestyle in their
retirement years.  For priests who are ill or
otherwise infirm, the Trust ensures they have
access to nursing home facilities and medical care.

Donation envelopes for The Shepherds’ Trust
Collection can be found beside the donation box in
the church foyer or in your box set of Sunday
Offering envelopes.  Thank you for your support of
this important work.

Your helping hand is the answer

NEW: Your year-end gift will double in value!

From now until the end of 2022, all contributions to
our parish’s ShareLife campaign will be matched by
an anonymous donor up to a total of $1 million.

“Vulnerable members of our community are relying
on you and me to ensure ongoing access to the
care they so desperately need. This is why it’s
crucial we meet our parish campaign goal of $13.8
million. Our goal can be met, but only if we each do
our part.” – Cardinal Thomas Collins

Our goal this year is $42,000.00. To date we have
achieved $35,185.70. Please give at the parish
using a ShareLife envelope, online through our
parish website:
stjohntheevangelistwe.archtoronto.org or at 
https://sharelife.org/donate/

2022 - 2023 Sunday Missals

The last weekend to use the current Sunday Missal
is November 19/20.  If you would like to purchase a
2022-2023 Sunday Missal for yourself, the parish is
selling them for $5.00 each.  Please see staff at the
counter in the church foyer and please have the
exact amount as no change will be available.

https://sharelife.org/donate/
http://stjohntheevangelistwe.archtoronto.org
https://sharelife.org/
https://stjohntheevangelistwe.archtoronto.org/



